
As-Garde Technology Continuum

- Pro-Active -
The Heart and Soul of Economic Nationalism

I hope to find out the response, the heart and soul, what really is important and how people 
respond to the series on Economic Nationalism. Response is important, so is initiative and 
endeavour, with a few people working together more is possible, and as we keep going in that 
direction, we continue to make real measurable tangible progress, even though it may seem 
nothing is happening, people get the point, increase in awareness and understanding, and the 
contrast helps make those decisions easier, more evident in wise, pro-active and empowering 
choices relevant to each individual.

I am writing more on the economic nationalism, to make it as real as it gets...

Having that contrast and relevant options will also make a more solid citizen and individual, 
unity makes the power, and faith is a super power, with the kind of confidence to go forward 
and make dedicated decisions, with moral courage and being able to do the math and 
understanding the character in the equation is essential for nation building. 

Happiness is being part of the solution, and also creating something new beyond problem 
solving, yet having that awareness of the problems, we can design and build something 
better. The design engineering and build quest for airplanes, trains, automobiles, boats, 
defence technology, machinery, tools, equipment, new products such as appliances, 
advanced manufacturing and assembly, high performance everything, even political party 
endeavours and revitalized government, is all possible with pro-active economic nationalism.

Imagine, happiness in building something awesome, you the individual made it happen, you 
helped make it happen, you can and do make a difference. Freedom of choice is in your 
power, all you need to do is exercise it, actions themselves are good, something pro-active in 
the direction you are going, aligned with your values is even better. Making decisions is 
empowering, being pro-active, actually doing something is like a super power. Faith is a super 
power, and faith can be increased, like confidence, physical and moral courage, with action, 
the right thoughts, the right words, almost like magic, physics, meta physics and multi-
dimensional physics.

Having that simple confidence and trust of going forward, making a decision, backed up with 
action, energized action, focused and dedicated action, determined action, action based on 
free will, a freely chosen purpose, goal, plan and vision, which can be simple or more 
comprehensive, like a national security, civil defence and defence technology endeavours. Is 
that something you could recognize if you see it and know about it? Is a national security 
emergency something that you are aware of and compelled and motivated to do something 
about, regardless of who you are and what you have, notwithstanding "credentials" "title" 
"resources" "social status" "money" "power" or anything else that keeps you from going 
forward? 
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Make effort not excuses, is that relevant to you? Do you need a little or a lot of 
encouragement, the right crowd, the right friends, the right environment? What do you think 
you need that you believe you don't have that keeps you from going forward? Initiative, 
endeavour, go in that direction, go by faith. Even though you may have what appears to be a 
valid excuse, or reason for not doing something, if you look for reasons to go forward, you will 
find those reasons. Purpose fueled with energy, duty, loyalty, valour, integrity, vision, real 
needs and ideals are all essential to integrate in aligning values with purposeful action.

Imagine what that feels like, imagine, what can you do today that could make your dreams 
come true, that your plan will succeed and be more successful. Imagine what boldness and 
audacity, or even something simple, to assert your independence, autonomy, free will, what 
would that be? Make a plan, work the plan, how simple can it be? Is that wise? Change your 
plan, keep going in the direction you choose, that vision, the future you envision,  dedicated to 
alternate reality creation, transforming thought into reality. 

The individual can actively plan for alternate reality creation, that is the future, to create the 
future. The individual can do that for personal plans, family plans, enterprise plans, industry 
plans, nation economic industrial plans, national and civil defence plans, plans for a 
revitalized awesome Made in Canada future that begins right here and right now. Individual 
effort is essential, how do you think all this is possible? Autonomy is empowering, freedom of 
choice is empowering, doing things because you want to and can is empowering and 
validating beyond measure.

No mass media, you don't need to be "validated" from anyone for anything. We did not need 
to be validated by the Americans with the Avro Arrow. We need self esteem, yes, like, we are 
awesome, look what we built, we don't need anyones approval, especially from the mass 
media anti nation state pro globalist cultural marxism crowd that does not want anyone to 
experience or have any sense of nationalism, or self defence, or integrated independent self 
sufficient industries, especially world class Made in Canada technology. 

We are building the next generation of the Avro Arrow, (CF-105 Arrow Incorporated) 
https://www.CF-105Arrow.ca, and going beyond that with even greater vision with Comeau 
Aerospace Inc. https://www.comeau-aerospace.ca because we can and want to with vision, 
purpose, ideals and integrity, a bold resolution to succeed, with the energy of aerospace, in 
addition to all kinds of other awesome things all Made in Canada.

Add to the equation, more visionary plans, defence technology, rebuilding our automotive, 
aerospace, marine, rail and machinery industries, our farm and agriculture industries, our 
mining and metal processing industries, general and advanced manufacturing industries, and 
yes, our private investing and private enterprise industries, which includes enterprise and 
national security rated personnel which are essential for any and all endeavours related to 
economic nationalism.

This also integrates a "pro-active economic nationalism" in enterprise. This means, not selling 
out the country and resources and technology, or doing business with people that want to put 
you out of business, counterfeit your products, sabotage your company, steal market share, 
bribe and payoff political, government and financial institutions and all the corresponding 
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"crime, treason, genocide, war and immorality" that goes with that. We can talk about it, 
because "we are privileged", we are also "politically correct" and each citizen has the right 
and responsibility to be informed, engaged and involved in, and part of the solution 
concerning National Economic Security, which includes everything, real money, Made in 
Canada defence technology and everything else. We write, talk, think and act, pro-actively, as 
this is the heart and soul series, of Economic Nationalism. 

How is that transforming thought into reality done with Economic Nationalism? Pro-active, 
step by step, action by action, achievement by achievement, focus, your resolution to 
succeed, patience, persistence, tenacity, resourcefulness, inventing your way, deal with 
problems, problems are temporary, keep going forward. Achievement becomes super 
achievement, you get better at it, maybe you have some help along the way, it could be 
encouragement, ideas, inspiration, developing new skills, abilities and maybe talents and 
aptitudes that you never knew you had. It always involves, expressing the best of who you 
are, and no matter who you are, you can make a difference.

Imagine how that feels like, make a difference eh, like running full speed, playing your 
favourite sports, you the star, the champion, imagine that, at work, investing, building, 
creating art and music, totally immersed in your zone of creative endeavour, mathematics, 
geometry, architectural design, construction, your trade, your hobby and past time, something 
you do for pure exhilaration, something you enjoy. Is that intense, exciting, super charging 
and revitalizing to you? 

Are you in your zone? Do you appreciate and benefit from people that can help you achieve 
your goals, as they work in their zone, with intensity, brilliant imagination, energy and vitality, 
with that rare excitement and enthusiasm, all out for you? 

If you take a look at : https://www.intergalactic-securities.ca you will find something extra-
ordinary, the idea that you can ; “Envision, plan, build & manage anything...” for Private 
enterprise, entities, capital structure and securities. Is that all out for you? Is that in the zone, 
is that altruistic ultra nationalist, or simply pro-active economic nationalism? It must be, since 
it is censored beyond measure, yet there it exists in space time, dedicated to you the 
individual, free enterprise, industry, Made in Canada, national defence and defence 
technology, in addition to a vast armada of pro-active and counter-measures against the 
magnitude of war vector scenarios against the nation state and economic nationalism. 

Who has got your back? Who will go back to back on the battlefield with you? Support Our 
Troops? And who will you go back to back on the battlefield with, side by side, what is your 
battle? What does your investment advisor, wealth manager or financial institution or broker, if 
you have one, know about it? What about your pension fund, eh? You are not alone!

Yes, Support our Troops eh? Pro-active Economic Nationalism will help a whole lot ore than 
having a sticker on your vehicle. It starts with Made in Canada eh? Say it, do it now!

Imagine for a moment, what it would be like to be in the Canadian Armed Forces, dedicated, 
loyal, competent, focused, disciplined...and yet they need to go a lot further than the extra 
mile. Do you have any idea what it feels like for people in the Armed Forces to have to serve 
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a bunch of traitors in government, cultural marxists, people that sell out the country, peope 
that sabotage, delay, defund, and choose to decide on nothing, be nothing, do nothing, 
achieve nothing, invent nothing, build nothing, ok maybe just a little bit? 

Yes, where is all that Made in Canada, secure supply lines? Can you imagine, knowing how 
difficult it is to deal with "non-nationalists" mass media that is anti-nation state and a very real 
national security threat to Canada? Or what it is like to not have the resources, tools, 
weapons, program development or even greater vision to fulfill the Defence Mission? Or what 
about general and advanced manufacturing and qualified personnel to make it happen? 

Imagine, what it is like to have a work in progress for defence technology and vision on an 
unprecedented magnitude, (contrast that with the super imposed non-nationalist, anti nation 
state, anti defence environment) major vehicle and weapons platforms built, to get funding 
and resources, to have that champion that understand technology, weapons, doctrine, and 
can have a field day in strategic, tactical and operational environments, in addition to 
industrial economic and enterprise environments? 

Now, imagine a little more the reality of the wasteland that is now Canada, with political 
parties infiltrated, deceptive leaders and agents with treasonous agendas, subversion, 
treason, race genocide, the "weaponized education system" with their badge of honour as 
treason, race hate, people that can't do math, fractions, don't understand money, never mind 
physics, chemistry, biology, people that can't write cursive and not even sign their name, 
people with toxic bodies and minds, corrupted by zero values of cultural marxism, 
communism, total treason and anti-white every where? Stupid people with no basic 
understanding of the real war, real history, or moral integrity, even less, national security rated 
and combat capable. Yes, this is still heart and soul talk. 

Who is pro-active in economic nationalism? You might ask that to really know, right? Looking 
at and knowing that many government people in political parties that are totally unfit for any 
form of civil service, who are against the nation state, who are active to super impose their will 
and ideology and government, as "enemy combatants" and "enemies foreign and domestic" 
and "collaborateurs" and are actually considered "national security threats"...Imagine knowing 
that, and not only from the general so called public intel official narrative level, the heart and 
soul level and the classified defence and intel agency point of view...imagine the nightmare, 
knowing what the real truth is about all that, and there it is. 

Now, the Canadian Armed Forces has other problems to deal with. Imagine a system of 
procurement that is simply backwards and obsolete, a system of control that renders it 
practically impossible or extremely difficult, unless certain things are done in certain ways 
"pre-approval", like crime, treason, genocide, war, sabotage, immorality is pre-approved, 
future kickbacks and job security is pre-approved. The problem in defence technology 
procurement was identified a very long time ago, in addition to all the infiltration, subversion, 
sabotage and treason problems with political parties and governments by "not real 
Canadians" not patriots, not nationalists, which are essential to proper government and 
national defence, including defence technology. 
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Now when you are interested in economic nationalism and national defence, and believe you 
can be pro-active about it, you can check out : https://www.battlegroup-301.ca and actually do 
something about it, that might be a whole lot more up to speed. So next time when your read 
about or hear about "Support our Troops" maybe you will understand that "due to national 
security reasons, freedom is not free" but there is whole lot you can do personally, in private 
investing in private enterprise with the most dedicated, visionary and ambitious people and 
defence technology development. After all, looking at the past when we build massive 
defence technology for air, land and naval forces, it is shocking how far we have fallen, since 
we had it all, and the people that could have defended it did not, the prime minister of treason 
and mass media propaganda anti nation state cultural marxist mind control...is nothing 
new...and we have tolerated that garbage for too long...like about 60 years too long...it is time 
for something awesome, Made in Canada Awesome! 

Are you that way for others? Are you responsive? Do you express interest and enthusiasm for 
others, are you supportive, encouraging, helpful, do you like to jump in with both feet, are you 
all heart and soul?

Yes, this heart and soul business is tricky eh? Everyone is different eh? Yes, and also there is 
common ground, what we value, what we believe in, what we dream about, what we wish for, 
what we work for, what we live for. What is common in the national psyche? Our tribe, our 
shared history, our traditional culture? Certainly we have common experience concerning 
Made in Canada, the war against the family, the war against free enterprise and the war 
agains the individual. 

What do you envision for Made in Canada Eh? What would you like to see Made in Canada 
eh? Stealth submarines, space planes, an awesome pickup truck not made with rotten metal, 
cheap plastic and garbage electronics? Something tough enough to put on some armour in 
case you need it? Cruise boats, army tanks, appliances? When was the last time you had a 
Made in Canada fridge? A washer and dryer? A stove? Power tools?

When we talk about Made in Canada, it includes the Canadian "ownership, voting, control" 
not foreign, and not by "enemy combatants" or "enemies foreign and domestic" after all we 
are "white nationalists eh!' Economic Nationalists! Imagine that, being accused of being a 
white nationalist and simply replying, "I am an Economic Nationalist that believe in Made in 
Canada, do you have a problem with that?" Yes I really do have a problem with the 95% of 
the stuff in stores NOT Made in Canada, it is considered really racist and not really inclusive, 
it is considered really like industrial genocide, industrial economic genocide, it is considered 
really like super imposed globalism, it is considered like a lot of treason and selling out the 
country, it is considered like a really aggressive and hateful thing to do to Canadians, no real 
relevant freedom of choice, and having to buy things from the enemy that is trying to kill us, 
defraud us, corrupt our government, change our laws, steal our technology, buy up our land 
and companies, liquidate entire industries and enterprise....

Can you increase your ability to identify the enemy, identify your friend and ally? Yes, 
certainly. As once people can identify the enemy, and the threats against economic 
nationalism and the individual, it will be easier for anyone to make a very valuable and 
mutually beneficial difference, for Canada and others. In this, the challenge and reward exists, 
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also to experience of the spirit of co-operation and working together, to be happy in the 
success of another and contribute to that success, as everyone has capabilities, resources, 
experience and perspective that can make all the difference. 

Building an enterprise, like construction, with the right foundation and materials for a certain 
purpose is essential. Having private co-operatives, buying and investment group endeavours 
in things that are important and relevant to each person and to others, aligned with true 
values, family values, Made in Canada productivity and prosperity is part of the foundation, 
along with working share-owners, and private investor shareholder capitalism.

We envision an increase in co-operative endeavours, invest and acquire, private investment 
and buying group options with money and resources in trust, to neutralize the industrial 
genocide against Canadian manufacturing industries from retail stores and globalism.

The problematic "anti nation state anti protectionist" crowd that enables, augments and 
amplifies foreign product dumping in Canada, along with currency wars, and the war from a 
foreign sovereign government against the free enterprise and entrepreneur, and also against 
our government, that should be truly sovereign and armoured against corruption, treason, 
selling out the country and doing all kinds of things that are actually national security threats 
to Canada and Canadians.

We envision going forward with confidence and optimism in a new magnitude of industrial 
economic security, productivity and prosperity, with a greater integrated vision of new wealth 
producing power that invents, innovates, has OEM and co-development, and increased 
capacity and competence of productive enterprise, with enterprise and national security rated 
people. 

We envision nationalists, nationalist character and vision, with an energy and enthusiasm of 
nation building, thoughtful intelligent and pro-active economic nationalism, pro-active 
patriotism, protectionism. Freedom of choice, we don't need cease and desist orders for buyig 
from the enemy, do we? We need to rapidly invest and build, deploy resources and people, 
produce high quality goods and solid quality, well paying family rated jobs, careers and 
enterprise commerce, something to write home about, right?

In the As-Garde Technology Continuum, our vision is making more things possible with 
people energized with creative imagination, general and advanced machinery and 
technology, in addition to general and specific industries, the strategic, tactical and 
operational advantage is integrated. This increases productivity, prosperity, performance, for 
the individual and enterprise, the industry and country. "Build a new machine" is not simply 
more gadgets, it is part of a greater productive enterprise, wealth producing power, where 
people can have challenge and reward and not worry about losing their job from traitors or 
foreign competition. 

We need to be dedicated to increasing new wealth producing power, new programs, 
products, services, technology, business combinations, prime contract, co-development, 
OEM, secure supply lines, self sufficiency...many hands make light work, and right now, it is 
time for all good citizens to come to the aid of their country, with national security 
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emergencies, to stand on guard for Canada, with Made in Canada.

You need to know, that it will take people dedicated to pro-active economic nationalism, the 
question remains to you the individual, how will you express the best of who you are? How 
will you make a difference? What will you do and what are you doing now? Will this pass into 
oblivion, or will you be encouraged, focused, determined...not to go through life on cruise 
control, or fall asleep at the wheel of economic nationalism, as the gears of industry, 
enterprise and investment yearn to have people that can work to build great things together, 
you the individual, someone with heart and soul. Energized, revitalized, productive and 
prosperous, challenge and adventure, discover everything awesome about Made in Canada 
Eh! Imagine, the future you can have by choice, powerful freedom of choice, you have it in 
your power, you have it in your heart and soul.
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